
Huntley Consolidated School District 158
Asphalt Pavement Construction & Replacement Bid #2024-19
BID OPENING at 3pm on 4.18.24        UNIT PRICES
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Base Bid Alternate 
Bid #1

Base + 
Alternate 

Remova
l $ per 
ton 10 
to 100 

Remova
l $ per 
ton 100 
to 1000

Install 
new 
base $ 
per ton 
10 to 
100 

Install 
new base 
$ per ton 
100 to 
1000

ALAMP No Bid
Champion X X X X X X X X  $   69,350.00 58,500.00$    127,850.00$  80.00$  60.00$ 70.00$ 45.00$   

Everlast Blacktop #1 X X X X X X X 87,000.00$    57,600.00$    144,600.00$  70.00$  65.00$ 45.00$ 40.00$   

Geske No Bid
Maneval Paving No Bid
Murphy Construction X X X X X X X X 114,400.00$    50,500.00$      164,900.00$  60.00$  60.00$ 43.90$ 43.90$   
Obsidian Asphalt #1 X X X X X X X 68,500.00$      60,500.00$      129,000.00$  50.00$  32.00$ 61.00$ 54.00$   
Schroeder Asphalt X X X X X X X X 69,999.00$      45,000.00$      114,999.00$  35.00$  32.00$ 40.00$ 37.00$   
TAT Enterprises Inc. No Bid

SPECIAL NOTES:
#1 - No Addenda Acknowledged


